
Contract No. 1213-004

 Bid Tabulation Report
Liquid Petroleum Gas

Bids Opened:     June 22, 2012
Bidder No. 1 Bidder No. 10

Ferrell Gas Amerigas

Cash Discount offered none none

Description Price Per Price Per
Hazmat Surcharge Per Delivery

0.91 1.08
Fuel Recovery Fee Per Delivery

0.91 1.08

8500 Clean Water Way, Reno, NV
0.91 1.08

Bartley Ranch Park -1855 Del Monte Lane
0.91 1.08

Bowers Mansion -4005 Old Highway 395
0.91 1.08

Bowers Park – Maint -3905 Old Highway 395
0.91 1.08

Cold Springs Park - 3375 White Lake Pkwy
0.91 1.08

Davis Creek Park - 25 Davis Creek - East RR's 0.91 1.08
Davis Creek Park - 25 Davis Creek – Office

0.91 1.08

Davis Creek Park - 25 Davis Creek – Showers 0.91 1.08

Davis Creek Park - 25 Davis Creek - West RR's 0.91 1.08

Davis Creek Park - 25 Davis Creek - Prk Housing 0.91 1.08

Galena Camp - 18350 Mt Rose Hwy - RR's 0.91 1.08

Galena Camp - 18350 Mt Rose Hwy - Bldgs 0.91 1.08

Galena Creek - 18350 Mt Rose Hwy – Stone House 0.91 1.08
Galena Creek - 18350 Mt Rose Hwy - Marylyn Pond

0.91 1.08
No Valleys Reg Park - 8085 Silver Lake Blvd

0.91 1.08

Rifle Range - 21555 Pyramid Lk Hwy 0.91 1.08

So Valleys Reg Park - 15650 Wedge Parkway 0.91 1.08

Vya - Roads Maint Shop no bid 1.08
Galena Creek - 18100 Mt Rose Hwy -- Ranger
House 0.91 1.08

Galena Creek - 18100 Mt Rose Hwy -- Shop 0.91 1.08

Washoe County

Citry of Sparks
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RSR- Mus- GBA - 1595 No Sierra St – Discovery 0.91 1.08

Gerlach - Roads Maint - Del Ora & Fir no bid 1.08
Ger - Sheriff Residence - 330 W Sunset

no bid 1.08

Ger – Courthouse - 330 W Sunset no bid 1.08

Ger - Senior Center - 385 E Sunset no bid 1.08
SFPD Headquarters - 3905 Old 395, Washoe Valley,
NV 89701 0.91 1.08
Station 30 - 3905 Old 395, Washoe Valley, NV 89701

0.91 1.08
SFPD Station 30 - 3905 Highway 395, Washoe 
Valley, NV 89706 0.91 1.08
SFPD Station 35 - 100 South Garson Road, Verdi, 
NV 89439 0.91 1.08
SFPD Station 35 - 100 South Garson Road, Verdi, 
NV 89439 0.91 1.08
SFPD Station 38 - 16255 Mt. Rose Highway, Reno,
NV 89511 0.91 1.08
SFPD Station 38 - 16255 Mt. Rose Highway, Reno,
NV 89511 0.91 1.08
Cold Springs VFD - 250 South Avenue, Reno, NV 
89506 0.91 1.08
Galena VFD - 16133 Mt. Rose Highway, Reno, NV 
89511 0.91 1.08
Peavine VFD - 110055 Longview Lane, Reno, NV 
89506 0.91 1.08
Redrock VFD - 16180 Red Rock Road, Reno, NV
895082 0.91 1.08

Gerlach VFD - 420 Cottonwood, Gerlach, NV 89412 no bid 1.08

Getto Transportation Center, GroundsKeeper Bldg. - 
1850 Kleppe, Sparks, NV 89434 0.91 1.08
Marvin Picollo School - 900 Foothill Road, Reno, NV
89511 0.91 1.08
McQueen High School - 6055 Lancer St. Reno

0.91 1.08
North Valley Trans. Shop Maintenance - 330 
Doubleback Road, Reno, NV 89506 0.91 1.08
Pleasant Valley Elementary School -  405 Surrey 
Drive, Reno, NV 89521 0.91 1.08

Wshoe County School District
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Reno High B-Ball Stadium -  395 Booth Street, Reno, 
NV 89509 0.91 1.08
Reno High Tennis Courts - 395 Booth Street, Reno,
NV 89509 0.91 1.08
Wadsworth High School – Gymnasium -  Old School 
Rd., Wadsworth  0.91 1.08

Hunter Creek Reservoir -  4900 Ross Drive, Reno, 
NV 89509 0.91 1.08

100
0.00 1.00

120
0.00 1.00

172
0.00 1.00

288
0.00 1.00

350
0.00 1.00

499
0.00 1.00

500
0.00 1.00

550
0.00 1.00

575
0.00 1.00

800
0.00 1.00

1000
0.00 1.00

1150
0.00 1.00

Price per gallon of smaller purchases of LPG if
obtained at your facility 0.91 1.18
facility locations attached

yes yes
Total Bid Price Written in Words? y/n yes yes
Bidder Information Provided yes yes

Licensing Information Provided yes yes
Proposal Summary Executed yes yes

TMWA

rental tanks  at various locations, for joinder agencies,  not currently utilizing their 
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